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BID RESULTS
05/23/2022

1/6/21 Cold Patch Bidder Material

Unique Paving Materials UPM Cold Mix

Lakeland Asphalt BMP-7 

Awarded to Ace Saginaw Paving Co QPR

1/6/21 Concrete/Cement Bidder Concrete-3500 Concrete-4500 Cement Awarded in Best Interest

Rock Products $124.23/cyd $128.75/cyd N/A by pound $17.00/bag

R & R Ready Mix, Inc $126.00/cyd $130.00/cyd N/A by pound $15.00/bag

1/6/21 Liquid Calcium Chloride Bidder Continuous Intermittent Road Commission Pickup

The Wilkinson Corporation $.17 p/gal $.20 p/gal $.15 p/gal

Michigan Chloride Sales, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid

Liquid Calcium Chloride Sales $.587 p/gal $.597 p/gal $.4  p/gal Awarded to Liq Calc (Bay Dust)

1/20/22 Cr. Gravel See Attached

Awarded in Best Interest of TCRC

1/20/22 Hired Equipment Various equip/bidders Awarded in Best Interest of TCRC As Needed

1/20/22 Bray Rd Non-motorized Bike Path Contractor LSUM

Marlette Exc $457,706.80

Awarded to DCC DCC Construction $337,254.35

Nicol and Sons $345,671.50 *Error in math

2/3/22 Chip Seal Awarded in Best Interest

Contractor Contract Item Pay Unit Unit Price

Fahrner Asphalt Sealers LLC Chip Seal, Single Syd $1.85

Chip Seal, Double Syd $3.65

Chip Seal, Prime and Double Syd $4.10

Seal, Polymer Scrub (PASS) Syd $2.28

Raised Pavement Markers Each $1.00

Seal, Fog Syd $0.35

Seal, Bar 12'-3' Syd $1.96

Highway Mtc & Const Chip Seal, Single Syd $2.08

Chip Seal, Double Syd $4.13

Chip Seal, Prime and Double Syd $4.57

Seal, Polymer Scrub (PASS) Syd $2.35

Raised Pavement Markers Each $1.50

Seal, Fog Syd $0.41

Seal, Bar 12'-3' Syd $2.08

Pvmt Mtc Systems LLC Chip Seal, Single Syd $1.84

Chip Seal, Double Syd $3.74

Chip Seal, Prime and Double Syd $4.18

Seal, Polymer Scrub (PASS) Syd $2.18

Raised Pavement Markers Each $1.50

Seal, Fog Syd $0.39

Seal, Bar 12'-3' Syd $2.35

2/3/22 Crush, Shape, Stabilize Awarded to PRI

HMA Base Crushing and 

shaping and compaction, 

4 inch (Local Road)

HMA Base Crushing shaping 

and Compaction, 8 inch 

(Primary Road) Water     Dust palliative, Applied

Bituminous Material 

Fog Coat (SS-1h)

1" Additional Crushing and 

Shaping

Asphalt Cement 

Stabilized Base 

Course, 4"

Asphalt Cement 

Binder

PRI $1.15 SYD $1.15 SYD $25.00 Unit $250 Ton $3.00 Gallon $0.12 SYD $1.59 SYD $3.32 Gallon

FDR Portland Cement

             FDR Portland Stab. 

Base Course, 6"

FDR Base Material Mix 

Design

PRI $225 Ton $5,000 Lump Sum $4.50 SYD

$98.85

$94.00

$94.00

Price Per Ton
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2/3/22 Machine Patches Awarded in Best Interest

Local Road Price Per Ton 10 to 50      50 & over Skip Patching > 50 Skip Patching HMA<50 Butt Joint      HMA Surf Rmvl Cold Milling 1/2 day Cold Milling Whole Day

Contractor 0 to 5                  6 to 10

Astec Asphalt $390.00      $330.00 $170.00    $155.00 $148.00 $155.00 $900.00   $25.00 $3,200.00 $4,900.00

Mr. Asphalt $380.00     $290.00 $220.00    $165.00 $245.00 $165.00 $50.00   $50.00 $3,450.00 $5,950.00

Pavement Recycling Inc No Bid    No Bid No Bid    No Bid No Bid   No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,000.00 $5,000.00

Primary Road Price Per Ton 10 to 50      50 & over Skip Patching > 50 Skip Patching HMA<50

Contractor 0 to 5                  6 to 10

Astec Asphalt $450.00      $350.00 $175.00   $160.00 $150.00 $158.00

Mr. Asphalt $450.00     $320.00 $260.00  $195.00 No Bid  No Bid  

Pavement Recycling Inc No Bid  No Bid No Bid   No Bid No Bid  No Bid  

2/3/22 Professional Engineering and Bridge Design Services Awarded to Spicer

Structure No 10630, 10631, 10632 Barnes Rd over Perry Creek

Consultant Lum Sum Cost

Proposed Preliminary 

Structure Type

R.S. Scott $210,000.00

SN 10630-Spread Box on 

Curtain wall   SN 10630 1/2-

Precast, 3 sided culverts

Spicer Group $144,000.00

Composite Steel 

Girder/Prestressed Concrete 

I-Beam, Precast Culvert, 

Precast Culvert

2/3/22 Professional Engineering and Bridge Design Services Awarded to Spicer

Structure No 10472 Akron Rd Over the Northwest Drain Outlet 3/Structure No 10608 Garner Rd over the Northwest Drain Outlet 2

Consultant Lum Sum Cost

Proposed Preliminary 

Structure Type

R.S. Scott Associates Inc $120,000.00 Precast, 3 sided culverts

Spicer Group Inc $110,600.00

Composite Steel 

Girder/Prestressed Concrete 

I-Beam

2/3/22 Professional Engineering and Bridge Design Services

Structure No 10627 Clothier Rd over the White Creek Drain #2

Consultant Lum Sum Cost

Proposed Preliminary 

Structure Type

NO BIDS

2/17/22 Roadside Spray Awarded to Dalton's

Bidder

Primary/Local Cattails or 

Phragmites Item A Per Gallon of 

Mixed Solution Applied

Primary Brush Item B Per 

Gallon of Mixed Solution 

Applied

Local Brush Item C Per 

Gallon of Mixed 

Solution Applied

RXR & Local 

Intersections Item D 

Per Gallon of Mixed 

Solution Applied

Guardrail Typical Item E 

Per Lineal Foot Applied

The Dalton's $2.15 p/gal $1.19 p/gal $1.19 p/gal $1.29 p/gal $0.089 p/lft

2/17/22 Waterproofing Membrane Awarded to Astec

Location DCC Construction Grand River Construction Astec Asphalt

Bay Park Rd Bdg Vassar $31,530.00 $30,480.00 $18,600.00 LSUM

Bay Park Rd Bdg Kirk $57,730.00 $53,420.00 $28,580.00 LSUM

Bay Park Rd Bdg Thomas $37,685.00 $30,140.00 $19,690.00 LSUM

Ackerman Rd Bdg $46,085.00 $49,660.00 $44,060.00 LSUM

Ashmore Rd Bdg $52,535.00 $56,400.00 $39,445.00 LSUM

3/3/22 Streets Signs Awarded to Dornbos

3/3/22 CMPipe Bids Awarded to Cadillac Culvert

Jensen Bridge St Regis Culvert Cadillac Culvert

$40,660.52 $40,11.12 $40,056.00



2022

BID RESULTS
05/23/2022

3/3/22 Pavement Marking Bids Awarded to P.K. 

3/17/22 Seed, Mulch, and Rip Rap Awarded to Nicol and Sons

3/17/22 Cr.Limestone See Att'd.

3/17/22 Grade, Base, Drainage Design, Bevens, Bliss, Wells Tabled 3/17/22

Contractor Bevens Rd, Dead End .4 mi to M-24 Bliss Rd, Leix to Wireline Wells Rd, Chambers E 1 mi

Spicer Group $44,850.00 $60,125.00 $61,750.00

Spalding DeDecker $43,250.00 $59,875.00 $67,400.00

Surveying Solutions $17,800.00 $23,125.00 $27,225.00

3/17/22 Grade, Base, Drainage Design, Livermore Tabled 3/17/22

Contractor Livermore, English to Phillips

Spicer Group $59,500.00

Spalding DeDecker $69,875.00

Surveying Solutions $23,125.00

3/31/22 Guardrail-County Wide Awarded to Nationwide

Bid Items Unit Nationwide Action Traffic

Unit Price           Salv Price Unit Price      Salv Price

Guardrail, Type B FT $35.00         N/A $35.00    $25.00

Guardrail, Type T FT $45.00        N/A $50.00    $35.00

Guardrail, Type MGS-8 FT $35.00        N/A $35.00    $25.00

Guardrail Long Span B-25 (25' Clear Span) Each $3,500        N/A $3,500.00   $2,200.00

Guardrail, Curved, Type B FT $40.00        N/A $40.00   $30.00

Guardrail, Curved, Type MGS-8 FT $40.00        N/A $55.00   $30.00

Guardrail Approach Terminal, Type 1B Each $3,000.00     N/A $3,400.00   $3,100.00

Guardrail, Approach Terminal, Type 2B Each $3,500.00     N/A $3,800.00   $3,100.00

Guardrail, Approach Terminal, Type 2M Each $3,750.00      N/A $3,800.00    $3,100.00

Guardrail, Departing Terminal, Type B Each $800.00       N/A $1,500.00   $1,100.00

Guardrail, Departing Terminal, Type MGS Each $800.00       N/A $1,500.00   $1,100.00

Guardrail, Type, XX, Modified (Increase in cost per foot of specified guardrail for installing 8' posts) FT $5.00          N/A $39.00   $29.00

Guardrail Reflector Each $7.00          N/A $6.00   $5.00

Guardrail Removal FT $5.00          N/A $18.00   N/A

Mobilization, Includes Traffic Control LSUM $800.00      N/A $850.00  N/A

3/31/22 Category B-Akron and Gagetown Tabled 3/3/1/22

Contractor Village of Gagetown Village of Akron Total Bid

Pyramid Paving $210,162.75 $186,882.00 $397,044.75

Ace Saginaw Paving $202,364.70 $188,465.80 $390,830.50

DCC Construction $258,447.00 $276,960.00 $535,407.00

3/31/22 Bradford and Quanicassee Guardrail Awarded to Nationwide

Contractor Bradford Road Quanicassee Road Total Bid

Action Traffic $45,939.00 $43,909.60 $89,848.60

Nationwide Const. Group $33,895.00 $31,555.00 $65,450.00

3/31/22 Bridge Inspection Request for Proposals Awarded to Rowe

Contractor

Cost per Bridge Insp (Inc. report 

and submittal)

Cost per Load Rating 

Analysis (Inc form updating 

and report submitall) Tier 3 

simple plan analysis

Tier 3 simple span 

analysis with field 

inspection/verfication 

required

Cost per Scour Plan 

of Action (Inc Form 

Completion)

Cost per Underwater Bridge 

Inspection (if needed)

Rowe Prf Services $250.00 $600.00 $1,200.00 $200.00 N/A

Great Lakes Eng $260.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 $200.00 $7,100.00

Spicer Group $350.00 $650.00 $850.00 $210.00 $5,500.00
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4/14/22 Awarded to Gentner

Plester $989,659.80

Blue Restoration $1,308,643.00

Marlette Exc $1,082,116.00

Gentner Exc $751,748.50

G,B,&Drainage-Fairgrove Twp, Dutcher Rd-Merry to M-24


